
 
 

 

            
 

             

          

            

 

              

           

                        

 

   
  

 

 

 

       

  

 

  

    

   

PURCHASING AGENDA ITEM 
Hernando County School District 

School Board Approval Meeting:   September 20,  2022  

Bid  No.  23-240-13  PB  Bid  Title:  Smallwares  

Recommend approval of this agenda item under  the specific category below:  

☐Lowest Bid(s)  ☐Request for Proposal(s)   ☐Low Bid(s) Meeting Specification   ☐Rejection/Cancellation   

☐Revised Award  ☐Renewal of Contract   ☐Sole Source     ☐Re-Award  (Partial/Whole)  

☐Bid Termination  ☐Revisions/Amendments to Bid  ☐Bid Extension     ☐Emergency  

☐Reversed Auction  ☒   Piggyback Cooperative  
 

 

Bid Contract Period: 09/20/2022 through 08/31/2025 ☐ N/A – One Time Purchase 

Contract Type: ☐ Estimated ☐ Firm, Fixed ☐ Firm, Fixed ☒ Firm, Fixed Unit Prices, 

Dollar Amount Dollar Amount Unit Prices Hourly Rates, Fees and/or 

Percentages 

Renewal Options: No. of Terms ☐ Length of ☐ Length of ☒ None 

Remaining Each Term (month) Each Term (year) 

Rationale/Reason: Piggyback the School District of Manatee County, Florida SDMC #23-0029-BS, Smallwares, 

awarded to 11400, Inc.  HCSB Bid #23-240-13 PB has been assigned for internal tracking purposes. 

Bidders Electronically   Bids Received:  No Bids:   Late Bids:  Rejected Bids:              N/A  –   Bids Not  

Downloaded From Public                                Required:   Piggyback  

Purchase Website:    

 

Submitted  By:  Neil McDonald      School(s):   District  Wide  

   Director of  Purchasing & Warehousing  

 

 

Requested  By:  Lori Drenth       Department(s):   Food  & Nutrition  

   Director of  Food  &  Nutrition   

    

 

Recommended award, description of items and prices: (See attached) 

T/C CODE: 2313 



 
   

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

  

  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 
  

 
  

   

  

  

 
  

 
  

 

 

 
   

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ATTACHMENT #1 
All Items Are Approved Brands 

Line # Category Item Number Description Size Price 

1 Bun Pan Racks/Covers 747545114792 
Rack Sheet Pan/Bun OVEN End Load (4" oven plated casters)-
500 LB - Advance Tabco CFL20 Spec Line EA $ 1,242.00 

2 Bun Pan Racks/Covers 400011217662 
Rack Sheet Pan/Bun Heavy Duty 6" spacing UNIVERSAL End 
Load - 500 LB - 10 pan capacity -  Advance Tabco UR10 EA $ 1,447.88 

3 Bun Pan Racks/Covers 400011951528 
Rack Sheet Pan/Bun Heavy Duty 3" spacing UNIVERSAL- 20 
pan capacity - Winco AXD-UTR line EA $ 1,003.50 

4 Bun Pan Racks/Covers 400011951559 
Rack Sheet Pan/Bun Heavy Duty 6" spacing UNIVERSAL- 10 
pan capacity - Winco AXD-UTR line EA $ 1,048.50 

5 Bun Pan Racks/Covers 747545145451 
Rack Sheet Pan/Bun  Light Duty Side Load- 500LB MAX -
Advance Tabco PR20-3WS 20 pan capacity  - Assembled EA $ 237.74 

6 Bun Pan Racks/Covers 747545145444 
Rack Sheet Pan/Bun Light Duty End Load - 500LB MAX -
Advance Tabco PR20-3W 20 Pan capacity  - Assembled EA $ 228.74 

7 Bun Pan Racks/Covers 76069681726 

842169136240 

690409100bk 

Rack Sheet Pan/Bun Heavy Duty Side Load - 800 LB MAX -
Winco - AWRK-20 20 Pan capacity - Assembled EA $ -

8 

9 

Bun Pan Racks/Covers 

Carts & Mobile Bins 

Rack Sheet Pan/Bun Heavy Duty End Load - 1000 LB MAX -
Winco - AWRK-20BK 20 Pan capacity - Assembled 

Cart Utility / Bussing with 3 Shelves Rubbermaid Black - 42" x 
20"x37" (12" spacing) 

EA 

EA 

$ 

$ 

-

149.99 

10 Carts & Mobile Bins 690FG45259BK 
Cart Utility, 2 shelf HD Black Medium Flat  Utility Cart with 
Extended Handle  Rubbermaid FG452589BLA EA $ 299.99 

11 Carts & Mobile Bins 475UCLG2FTBK 
Cart Utility, 2 shelf HD Black Medium Flat  Utility Cart with 
Extended Handle Lavex Industrial 475UCLG2FTBK EA $ 299.99 

12 Carts & Mobile Bins 29419087655 
Cart Utility 3 Shelf Stainless Steel  39 1/2" x 21" x 33 1/4" 
Vollrath 97140 EA $ 823.50 

13 Carts & Mobile Bins 400010172931 
Cart Utility 3 Shelf Stainless Steel Vollrath 97105  24" x 16" x 
36 1/2" (not assembled) EA $ 234.74 

14 Carts & Mobile Bins 690FG9T13BK 
Truck Cart Tilt/Trash  Black 0.5 Cubic Yard  (450LB) 
Rubbermaid FG9T1300BLA EA $ 524.99 

15 Carts & Mobile Bins 690FG9T15BK 
Truck Cart Tilt/Trash  Black 1.0 Cubic Yard  (1250 lb.) 
Rubbermaid FG9T1500BLA EA $ 943.50 

16 Carts & Mobile Bins 405DTT8648 

Truck Hand/Platform 2-Position Convertible  800 lb. with 10" 
x 2" Solid Rubber Wheels and 5" Urethane Casters  Harper 
DTT18648A EA $ 589.49 

17 Covers Disposable 517SUPROBMW 

Cover, Bun Rack 23" x 28" x 62", Reusable, White Supro 
Breathable Mesh Bun / Sheet Pan Rack Cover - Curtron 
SUPRO-BM-W EA $ 202.49 

18 Covers Disposable 10738101799710 Cover, Bun Rack 52" x 80" Disposable Handgards RL $ 29.99 

19 Covers Disposable 10738101799796 Cover Plastic Bun Pan  on a Roll 21" x 6" x 35" - Handgards RL $ 108.74 

20 Cutlery 78731985026 
Knife White Plastic 6 1/2" Individually Wrapped Medium 
Weight  - 1000/Case CS $ 23.24 

21 Cutlery 10078731903157 
Fork White Plastic 6 1/8" Individually Wrapped Medium 
Weight - 1000/Case CS $ 23.24 

22 Cutlery 10078731903591 
Teaspoon White Plastic Individually Wrapped Medium 
Weight  - 1000/Case Choice CS $ 23.24 

23 Cutting Boards 407201575WH Board Cutting  White Polyethylene 20" x 15" x 1/2" EA $ 18.74 

24 Cutting Boards 40718125WH Board Cutting White Polyethylene 18" x 12" x 1/2" EA $ 11.99 

25 Cutting Boards 844437521 Rack Cutting Board 6-Board Black EA $ 22.49 

26 Disposables 658128420042 Liner Pan 1/2 Size Deep Steam Table Nylon  - 100/Box BX $ 35.99 

27 Disposables 400010119424 Liner Pan 1/2 Size Shallow Steam Table Nylon - 100/Box BX $ 33.74 

28 Disposables 400010119455 Liner Pan Full Size Deep Steam Table Nylon  - 50/Box BX $ 126.74 

Vendor Item Number 

109CFL20 

109UR10 

240401ANHD 

240UR10 

109APR1826L 

109APR1820L 

No Bid 

No Bid 

109CARTBLGBK 

475UCLG2FTBK 

475UCLG2FTBK 

600CT2239WD8 

600CT1627KD 

475TT05450BK 

475TT10125BK 

405DTT8648 

517SUPROBMW 

409RC80 

130BRC8G3122100 

130WKNIFEWP 

130WFORKWP 

130WSPOONWP 

40720155WH 

40718125WH 

844437521 

5722214 

5722310 

572PTL3418 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 
  

  

  
  

 
  

 

 

 
 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Copy of Attachment 1 Smallwares Price Sheet 

ATTACHMENT #1 
All Items Are Approved Brands 

Line # Category Item Number Description Size Price 

29 Disposables 654866031182 Liner Pan Full Size Shallow Steam Table Nylon  - 100/Box BX $ 83.24 

30 Food Carriers 2141210PW Warmer pellet heat retentive CAMBRO granite gray EA $ 162.74 

31 Food Carriers 214GBD2115BK Bag Stadium Cambro insulated Jumbo Blk Delivery Go Bag EA $ 117.00 

32 Food Storage FG330700CLR Box Food Storage Clear 2 GAL 18" x 12" x 3.5" Rubbermaid EA $ 14.54 

33 Food Storage FG330900CLR Box Food Storage Clear 3.5 GAL 18" x 12" x 6" EA $ 17.99 

34 Food Storage FG330000CLR Box Food Storage Clear 12.5 GAL 26" X 18" X 9" EA $ 46.49 

35 Food Storage FG331000CLR Lid Food Storage Clear  18" x 12" EA $ 10.49 

36 Food Storage FG330200CLR Lid Food Storage Clear  26" x 18" EA $ 20.24 

37 Food Storage 99511325603 Pan Food 1/9 Size Clear 4" Deep Clear Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 3.74 

38 Food Storage 99511520770 Pan Food 1/9 Size Clear 6" Deep Clear Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 5.24 

39 Food Storage 99511326853 Pan Food 1/6 Size Clear 4" Deep Clear Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 3.74 

40 Food Storage 99511326891 Pan Food 1/6 Size Clear 6" Deep Clear Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 4.94 

41 Food Storage 99511326778 Pan Food 1/4 Size Clear 4" Deep Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 5.99 

42 Food Storage 99511326815 Pan Food 1/4 Size Clear 6" Deep  Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 6.89 

43 Food Storage 99511326518 Pan Food 1/2 Size Clear 4" Deep Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 5.99 

44 Food Storage 99511326556 Pan Food 1/2 Size Clear 6" Deep Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 10.94 

45 Food Storage 99511325955 Pan Food 1/2 Size LONG Clear 4" Deep Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 12.74 

46 Food Storage 99511325771 Pan Food Full Size  4" Deep Clear Polycarbonate EA $ 15.74 

47 Food Storage 99511325856 Pan Food Full Size 6" Deep Clear Polycarbonate EA $ 20.99 

48 Food Storage 99511327034 Lid Flat 1/9 Size Clear Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 2.09 

49 Food Storage 99511327577 Lid Handled 1/6 Size Clear Polycarbonate  Cambro EA $ 2.24 

50 Food Storage 99511327591 Lid Handled 1/4 Size Clear Polycarbonate  Cambro EA $ 2.99 

51 Food Storage 99511327508 Lid Handled 1/2 Size Clear Polycarbonate  Cambro EA $ 5.54 

52 Food Storage 99511327485 Lid Flat 1/2 LONG Size Clear Polycarbonate  Cambro EA $ 7.04 

53 Food Storage 99511327270 Lid Handled Full Size Clear Polycarbonate  Cambro EA $ 11.09 

54 Hand Sanitizer 381P272012GY 
Dispenser Purell  Dove Gray Touchless Hand Sanitizer 2720-
12 TFX 1200 mL EA $ 84.83 

55 Hand Sanitizer 381P192004WH 
Dispenser Purell 1920-04 LTX-12 1200 mL White Touchless 
Hand Sanitizer Dispenser EA $ 84.83 

56 Hand Sanitizer 381P190302 
Sanitizer Hand Gel Purell 1903-02 LTX Advanced Green 
Certified 1200 mL  - 2/Case CS $ 58.23 

57 Hand Sanitizer 381P545604 
Sanitizer Hand Gel Purell 5456-04 TFX Advanced 1200 mL -
4/Case CS $ 123.89 

58 Janitorial 27141082BKKT 
Broom 12" Angled with Black Flagged Bristles and 48" Handle 
Carlisle Sparta Spectrum Duo-Sweep EA $ 20.99 

59 Janitorial 7961 Broom Corn Heavy-Duty Authentic Amish-Made EA $ 29.99 

60 Janitorial 71798005331 Broom, Push Smooth Surface EA $ 28.49 

61 Janitorial 20027206995 
Mop Bucket with Side-Press Wringer 35 Qt. Yellow Splash 
Guard Continental 335-312YW EA $ 74.99 

Vendor Item Number 

572PTL3412 

2141210PW 

214GBD2115RD 

247FB12183C 

247FB12186C 

247FB18269C 

247FBL1218CL 

247FBL1826CL 

247FP194CL 

247FP196CL 

247FP164CL 

247FP166CL 

247FP144CL 

247FP146CL 

247FP144CL 

247FP126CL 

247FP12L4CL 

247FP114CL 

247FP116CL 

247FP19LCL 

247FP16LHCL 

247FP14LHCL 

247FP12LHCL 

247FP12LLCL 

247FP11LHCL 

381P272012GY 

381P192004WH 

381P190302 

381P545604 

27136865 

7961 

27136219624 

274MOPBCKTYE 
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65

70

75

80

85

90

95

Copy of Attachment 1 Smallwares Price Sheet 

ATTACHMENT #1 
All Items Are Approved Brands 

Line # Category Item Number Description Size Price 

62 Janitorial 20027027408 Can Trash 20 Gallon Gray Continental 2000GY Huskee EA $ 26.99 

63 Janitorial 20027027507 Can Trash 32 Gallon Gray Continental 3200GY Huskee EA $ 32.99 

64 Janitorial 22500103 
Detergent Laundry Dye Free Liquid  Arm &amp; Hammer 50 
oz. 2X HE Perfume &amp;  8/Case CS $ 39.74 

Janitorial 6902640 Dolly Trash Can Continental 3255-8 Huskee EA $ 37.49 

66 Janitorial 29419886951 
Dolly Tray Rack ; Recycled Black Rack Dolly Base (No Handle) -
21" x 21" Vollrath EA $ 201.74 

67 Janitorial 14239001073 Dolly Tray Rack 26" x 22" x 5 3/4" Obris Bakery EA $ 112.49 

68 Janitorial 16719NUS Gloves Small Pot and Sink San Jamar 19NUM 19" Nitrile PR $ 23.24 

69 Janitorial 16719NUM Gloves Medium Pot and Sink San Jamar 19NUM 19" Nitrile PR $ 21.74 

Janitorial 16719NUL Gloves Large Pot and Sink San Jamar 19NUM 19" Nitrile PR $ 21.74 

71 Janitorial 16719NUXL Gloves X- Large Pot and Sink San Jamar 19NU-L 19" Nitrile PR $ -

72 Janitorial 1675325S Gloves Textured Freezer / Frozen Food PVC  Small 12" Red PR $ -

73 Janitorial 1675325M Gloves Textured Freezer / Frozen Food PVC  Large 12" Red PR $ 12.89 

74 Janitorial 1675325L Gloves Textured Freezer / Frozen Food PVC  Large 12" Red PR $ 11.54 

Janitorial 27140225WH Handle Broom  60" Threaded Fiberglass Carlisle 4022502 EA $ 18.74 

76 Janitorial 17183882293 Scrub Brush with Squeegee Carlisle 3619014 10" Hi-Lo Floor EA $ 19.49 

77 Janitorial 811642016508 Squeegee 24" Black Floor Cleaning EA $ 23.24 

78 Janitorial 690H115 Handle Mop  60" Quick Release Continental A70302 EA $ 17.24 

79 Janitorial 8442500RS 
Mat Floor Black Single Anti-Fatigue  1/2" Thick 2' 4" x 3' 
Cactus Mat 2500-RS Comfort Zone EA $ 23.99 

Janitorial 6901924812BL 
Mop Head Blue Large Maximizer Microfiber Rubbermaid 
1924812 EA $ 24.74 

81 Janitorial 271245BDLOOP 
Mop Head with 5" Band 24 oz. #32 Cotton Blend Loop End 
Lavex Janitorial EA $ 7.49 

82 Janitorial 6902531 Pan Dust Upright Plastic Rubbermaid FG253100BLA EA $ 13.49 

83 Janitorial 77838619674 Rack Dish All Purpose Full Size Carlisle RP14 EA $ 29.99 

84 Janitorial 77838519684 
Rack Tray Dish Full Size 19 3/4" x 19 3/4" x 4" Open End Peg 
Carlisle ROP14 Opticlean EA 

Janitorial 77838801536 Rack Full Size Combination / Flatware Carlisle RF14 Opticlean EA $ 29.99 

41.24 271ROP 

271RF 

271ROP 86 Janitorial 77838519684 
Rack Dish Peg Open End Full Size 19 3/4" x 19 3/4" x 4" 
Carlisle ROP14 Opticlean EA $ 41.24 

87 Janitorial 690611277YEL 
Sign Wet Floor  "Caution Wet Floor" Yellow Rubbermaid 
FG611277YEL 25" EA $ 8.99 

88 Janitorial 27140421 Squeegee Floor 10" Hi-Lo  with Scrub Brush Carlisle 3619014 EA $ 19.49 

89 Janitorial 27140076 Squeegee Floor 24" Black  Cleaning EA $ 23.24 

Janitorial 905PR350 Squeegee Window 14" Stainless Steel Unger PR350 PRO EA $ 71.24 

91 Janitorial 248WIPEPPKE Wipe Pink 13x20 standard duty foodservice 200/cs CS $ 25.49 

92 Janitorial 167701BRTBLS 
Towel Bar 100% Cotton 16" x 19" Blue Striped 32 oz 12/Pack  
Choice DZ $ 9.74 

93 Janitorial 167700BRT32 
Towel Cotton Ribbed Terry Bar 16" x 19" White 32 oz. -
12/Pack DZ $ 9.74 

94 Kitchen Utensils 407BRPN3 Brush 3" Pastry/Basting w/Nylon Bristle EA $ 14.09 

Kitchen Utensils 27140164 Brush Vegetable Sparta Spectrum Carlisle 4016402 EA $ 12.89 

Vendor Item Number 

475TCRND20GY 

475TCRND32GY 

22500103 

274TCDOLLY 

922169706 

474NPL700 

16719NUS 

16719NUM 

16719NUL 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

1675325L 

1675325XL 

27140225BK 

27140421 

27140076 

690H115 

844FNGRMT1 

6901924813BL 

271245BDLOOP 

274912BK 

271RP 

274WFSGN25 

27140421 

27140076 

905VP350 

248WIPERPKE 

167701BRTBLS 

167700BRT32 

2714040202 

27140164 
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100

105

110

115

120

125

130

Copy of Attachment 1 Smallwares Price Sheet 

ATTACHMENT #1 
All Items Are Approved Brands 

Line # Category Item Number Description Size Price 

96 Kitchen Utensils 27140671 
Brush Wire Grill  with Scraper Plastic Handle Carlisle 4067100 
Sparta EA $ 10.34 

97 Kitchen Utensils 3331K Can Opener Knife Edlund K004SP Equivalent EA $ 7.94 

98 Kitchen Utensils 407C12QTA Colander 12 Qt. Aluminum  with Base and Handles EA $ 24.74 

99 Food Storage 99511314171 
Container Food Storage with Winter Rose Gradations 2 Qt. 
Clear Square Polycarbonate Cambro 2SFSCW135 EA $ 6.44 

Food Storage 99511315475 
Container Food Storage 4 Qt. Clear Square Polycarbonate 
with Winter Rose Gradations Cambro EA $ 8.54 

101 Food Storage 99511316526 
Container  Food Storage 6 Qt. Clear Square Polycarbonate 
with Winter Rose Gradations Cambro EA $ 12.29 

102 Food Storage 99511317561 
Container  Food Storage 8 Qt. Clear Square Polycarbonate 
with Winter Rose Gradations Cambro EA $ 14.39 

103 Food Storage 99511311224 
Container Food Storage  with Red Gradations 12 Qt. Clear 
Square Polycarbonate  Cambro EA $ 17.99 

104 Food Storage 99511313631 
Container Food Storage with Winter Rose Gradations 18 Qt. 
Clear Square Polycarbonate  Cambro EA $ 26.99 

Food Storage 99511314898 
Container Food Storage with Winter Rose Gradations 22 Qt. 
Clear Square Polycarbonate Cambro EA $ 31.49 

106 Food Storage 99511346752 Cover Translucent 12, 18, and 22 Qt Clear Cambrowear EA $ 3.29 

107 Food Storage 99511346714 
Cover Translucent 2 and 4 Qt. Cambrowear Seal Cambro 
SFC2SCPP190 EA $ 1.79 

108 Kitchen Utensils 6903210 Cup Measuring 1 Cup Clear Plastic Choice EA $ 2.69 

109 Kitchen Utensils 6903215 Cup Measuring 1 Pint Clear Plastic Choice EA $ 3.59 

Kitchen Utensils 672333 Cup Measuring Set 4-Piece Stainless Steel ST $ 37.49 

111 Kitchen Utensils 6903216 
Cup Measuring with Gradations 1 Qt. (4 Cups) Clear Plastic 
Choice EA $ 4.79 

112 Kitchen Utensils 6903217 
Cup Measuring with Gradations  2 Qt. (8 Cups) Clear Plastic 
Choice EA $ 8.99 

113 Kitchen Utensils 6903218 Cup Measuring with Gradations 4 Qt. Clear Plastic  Choice EA $ 13.49 

114 Kitchen Utensils 694S196 
Cutter / Scraper with White Handle Tablecraft 4103W 6" x 4 
1/2" Stainless Steel EA $ 5.39 

Kitchen Utensils 591N555508 
Cutter Fruit / Vegetable Wedge 8 Section Easy Wedger 
Nemco 55550-8  (Wedgemaster) EA $ 261.53 

116 Kitchen Utensils 674651112902 Blade Wedge Cutter  Assembly Nemco 428-6 6 Section EA $ 63.53 

117 Kitchen Utensils 674651112926 
Blade Assembly 8 Section Easy Apple Corer  for 55550 Easy 
Wedger / Apple Corer Nemco 490-8 EA $ 80.03 

118 Kitchen Utensils 407370 Funnel 1 Qt. (32 oz.) White Plastic Choice EA $ 2.24 

119 Kitchen Utensils 220KWSLCSR10 
Knife  Serrated Edge 10" Slicing / Bread  with White Handle 
Choice EA $ 8.39 

Kitchen Utensils 470M23408 
Knife 8" Serrated Edge Utility Mercer Culinary M23408 
Millennia EA $ 8.24 

121 Kitchen Utensils 765301903237 Knife Chef  6" Mercer Culinary M20606 EA $ 7.49 

122 Kitchen Utensils 470M22612 Knife Chef 12" Mercer Culinary M22612 Millennia EA $ 10.34 

123 Kitchen Utensils 21029473 Knife Paring  3 1/2" Dexter-Russell 29473 V-Lo EA $ 1.94 

124 Kitchen Utensils 220KWPARSR4 Knife Paring  4" Serrated Edge with White Handle Choice EA $ 2.99 

Kitchen Utensils 407OPL2 Ladle 2 oz. One-Piece Stainless Steel EA $ 2.24 

126 Kitchen Utensils 407OPL4 Ladle 4 oz. One-Piece Stainless Steel EA $ 4.34 

127 Kitchen Utensils 407OPL6 Ladle 6 oz. One-Piece Stainless Steel EA $ 4.34 

128 Kitchen Utensils 407OPL8 Ladle 8 oz. One-Piece Stainless Steel EA $ 5.69 

129 Kitchen Utensils 4070120 
Lid 1/2 Size Stainless Steel 18/8 Solid Steam Table / Hotel  
Cover 24 gauge Choice brand EA $ 11.24 

Kitchen Utensils 4070130 
Lid 1/3 Size Stainless Steel 18/8 Solid Steam Table / Hotel  
Cover 24 gauge Choice brand EA $ 8.84 

131 Kitchen Utensils 4070140 
Lid 1/4 Size Stainless Steel 18/8 Solid Steam Table / Hotel  
Cover 24 gauge Choice brand EA $ 7.94 

132 Kitchen Utensils 4070160 
Lid 1/6 Size Stainless Steel 18/8 Solid Steam Table / Hotel  
Cover 24 gauge Choice brand EA $ 5.54 

133 Kitchen Utensils 4070190 
Lid 1/9 Size Stainless Steel 18/8 Solid Steam Table / Hotel  
Cover 24 gauge Choice brand EA $ 4.79 

Vendor Item Number 

27140671 

181COM1KNIFE 

40712QTALMHB 

2142SFSCW 

176SQRCL4 

247S6CL 

247S8CL 

176SQRCL12 

176SQRCL18 

176SQRCL22 

176SQRWHL12 

176SQRWHL2 

6903210 

6903215 

69032MCSET 

6903216 

6903217 

6903218 

694S196 

591N555508 

5914286 

5914908 

407370 

220KWSLCSR10 

220KWUTLYSR8 

220KWCHEF6 

220KWCHEF12 

220KWPAR325H 

220KWPARSR4 

407OPL2 

407OPL4 

407OPL6 

407OPL8 

4070120 

4070130 

4070140 

4070160 

4070190 
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135

140

145

150

155

160

165

Copy of Attachment 1 Smallwares Price Sheet 

ATTACHMENT #1 
All Items Are Approved Brands 

Line # Category Item Number Description Size Price 

134 Kitchen Utensils 4070110 
Lid Full Size Stainless Steel 18/8 Solid Steam Table / Hotel  
Cover 24 gauge Choice brand EA $ 19.49 

Kitchen Utensils 789313308033 
Pan 1/3 Size 2 1/2" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table 
/ Hotel - 24 Gauge EA $ 9.44 

136 Kitchen Utensils 789313308132 
Pan 1/3 Size 4" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel - 24 Gauge EA $ 11.24 

137 Kitchen Utensils 789313308231 
Pan 1/3 Size 6" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel - 24 Gauge EA $ 18.74 

138 Kitchen Utensils 789313308637 
Pan 1/6 Size 2 1/2" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table 
/ Hotel - 24 Gauge EA $ 5.69 

139 Kitchen Utensils 789313308736 
Pan 1/6 Size 4" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel - 24 Gauge EA $ 7.49 

Kitchen Utensils 789313308811 
Pan 1/6 Size 6" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel - 24 Gauge EA $ 11.09 

141 Kitchen Utensils 811642027757 
Pan 1/9 Size 2 1/2" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table 
/ Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 4.49 

142 Kitchen Utensils 789313309030 
Pan 1/9 Size 4" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 5.99 

143 Kitchen Utensils 4070969 
Pan 1/9 Size 6" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 10.94 

144 Kitchen Utensils 789313308330 
Pan 1/4 Size 2 1/2" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table 
/ Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 7.79 

Kitchen Utensils 789313308439 
Pan 1/4 Size 4" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 10.19 

146 Kitchen Utensils 789313308538 
Pan 1/4 Size 6" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 15.74 

147 Kitchen Utensils 789313307739 
Pan 1/2 Size 2 1/2" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table 
/ Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 11.69 

148 Kitchen Utensils 789313307838 
Pan 1/2 Size 4" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 14.39 

149 Kitchen Utensils 789313307937 
Pan 1/2 Size 6" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam Table / 
Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 21.74 

Kitchen Utensils 755576613528 
Pan 1/2 Size LONG 2 1/2" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel 
Steam Table / Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 15.74 

151 Kitchen Utensils 755576613535 
Pan 1/2 Size LONG 4" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam 
Table / Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 18.74 

152 Kitchen Utensils 755576613900 
Pan 1/2 Size LONG 6" Deep Anti-Jam Stainless Steel Steam 
Table / Hotel  - 24 Gauge EA $ 26.99 

153 Kitchen Utensils 789313307432 
Pan Full Size 2 1/2" Deep Stainless Steel Steam Table / Hotel -
24 Gauge Choice Anti-jam EA $ 18.74 

154 Kitchen Utensils 789313307531 
Pan Full Size 4" Deep Stainless Steel Steam Table / Hotel  - 24 
Gauge Choice  Anti-Jam EA $ 25.49 

Kitchen Utensils 789313307630 
Pan Full Size 6" Deep Stainless Steel Steam Table / Hotel  - 24 
Gauge Choice Anti-Jam EA $ 33.74 

156 Kitchen Utensils 645372304594 
Pan Sheet Full Size 18" x 26" Wire in Rim Aluminum 16 Gauge 
Carlisle 601826 EA $ 12.74 

157 Kitchen Utensils 407HALFSS 
Pan Sheet Half Size 13" x 26" Wire in Rim Aluminum 18 
Gauge Carlisle 601824 EA $ 8.24 

158 Kitchen Utensils 92247040 Slicer Egg Hinged Aluminum Stainless Steel Wires EA $ 9.59 

159 Kitchen Utensils 470M18750 
Spatula/Turner Mini 2 1/2" x 2 1/2"  Steel blade 
Polypropylene handle Mercer Culinary M18750 Millennia EA $ 9.89 

Kitchen Utensils 690FG19630RD 
Spatula 13 1/2" Red High Temperature Silicone Rubbermaid 
FG1963000000 EA $ 8.09 

161 Kitchen Utensils 92246973 Spoon Basting  13" Standard Duty Solid Stainless Steel EA $ 1.94 

162 Kitchen Utensils 92246975 Spoon Basting 13" Standard Duty Perforated Stainless Steel  EA $ 1.94 

163 Kitchen Utensils 9224781230 
Tongs 12" with Blue Coated Kool Touch  Handle Vollrath 
4781230 Jacob's Pride 12" Stainless Steel Scalloped EA $ 4.49 

164 Kitchen Utensils 271N4606BK Tongs 6" Black Plastic Salad Carlisle 460603 Carly   EA $ 2.24 

Kitchen Utensils 92247309 Tongs Utility 10" Heavy Duty Stainless Steel EA $ 3.29 

166 Kitchen Utensils 9804259700 
Wedger Egg 6-Slice with Stainless Steel Wires Aluminum 
Hand-Held  Matfer Bourgeat 215304 EA $ 46.49 

Vendor Item Number 

4070110 

4070329 

4070349 

4070369 

4070629 

4070649 

4070669 

4070929 

4070949 

4070969 

4070429 

4070449 

4070469 

4070229 

4070249 

4070269 

4070522 

4070542 

4070562 

4070029 

4070049 

4070069 

407BUNFULL 

407BUNHALF 

92247040 

470M18750 

40714HSPTULA 

407SBS13 

407SLBS13 

407CUT12BL 

271N4606BK 

92247309 

9804259700 
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Copy of Attachment 1 Smallwares Price Sheet 

ATTACHMENT #1 
All Items Are Approved Brands 

Line # Category Item Number Description Size Price 

167 Kitchen Utensils 407FRWHIP10 Whip / Whisk 10" Stainless Steel French EA $ 5.69 

168 Kitchen Utensils 407FRWHIP18 Whip / Whisk 18" Stainless Steel French EA $ 8.99 

169 Oven Mitts 167823TPH 
Grabber Terry Cloth Pan  11" x 10" - 12/Pack (Baker's Pad) 
San Jamar 823TPH DZ $ 3.74 

170 Oven Mitts 167802TPH Holder Pot Terry Cloth  8" x 8" - 12/Pack San Jamar 802TPH DZ $ 26.99 

171 Oven Mitts 167810CM15 Mitt Oven 15" Best Grip San Jamar 810CM15  EA $ 24.74 

172 Oven Mitts 167318 Sleeve Terry - Heat Resistant San Jamar SLWT16 EA $ 5.24 

173 Scoops/Dishers 92247146 
Disher 1 oz. #30 Black Thumb Press Vollrath 47146 Jacob's 
Pride EA $ 9.74 

174 Scoops/Dishers 92247143 
Disher 2 oz. #16 Blue Thumb Press Vollrath 47143 Jacob's 
Pride EA $ 9.74 

175 Scoops/Dishers 92247142 
Disher 2.66 oz #12 Green Thumb Press -  Vollrath 47142 
Jacob's Pride EA $ 9.74 

176 Scoops/Dishers 92247141 
Disher 3.25 oz. #10 Ivory Thumb Press Vollrath 47141 Jacob's 
Pride EA $ 9.74 

177 Scoops/Dishers 92247140 
Disher 4 oz. #8 Gray Thumb Press Vollrath 47140 Jacob's 
Pride  EA $ 9.74 

178 Scoops/Dishers 92247139 
Disher 5.33 oz  #6 White Thumb Press Vollrath 47139 Jacob's 
Pride EA $ 9.74 

179 Scoops/Dishers 10029419033574 
Disher 6oz #5 Squeeze Handle Teal Vollrath 47389 Jacob's 
Pride #5 EA $ 34.74 

180 Scoops/Dishers 29419033560 
Disher 8 oz #4 Squeeze Handle Orange Vollrath 47388 Jacob's 
Pride EA $ 34.74 

181 Scoops/Dishers 10029419426321 
Spoodle Portion 2 oz. Black Perforated Round Spoodle; 
Vollrath 6432220 Jacob's Pride EA $ 2.24 

182 Scoops/Dishers 29419426348 
Spoodle Portion 3 oz. Black Perforated Round Spoodle; 
Vollrath 6432320 Jacob's Pride EA $ 2.24 

183 Scoops/Dishers 9226432420 
Spoodle Portion 4 oz. Black Perforated Round Spoodle; 
Vollrath 6432420 Jacob's Pride EA $ 2.99 

184 Scoops/Dishers 29419426393 
Spoodle Portion 5 oz. Black Perforated Round Spoodle; 
Vollrath6432520 Jacob's Pride EA $ 18.98 

185 Scoops/Dishers 29419426423 
Spoodle Portion 8 oz. Black Perforated Round Spoodle; 
Vollrath 6432820  Jacob's Pride EA $ 2.99 

186 Scoops/Dishers 29419426454 Spoodle Portion 2 oz. Ivory Vollrath6433230Jacob's Pride EA $ 2.24 

187 Scoops/Dishers 10029419426475 Spoodle Portion 3 oz. Ivory Vollrath 6433335 Jacob's Pride EA $ 2.24 

188 Scoops/Dishers 29419426492 Spoodle Portion 4 oz. Gray Vollrath6433445Jacob's Pride EA $ 2.99 

189 Scoops/Dishers 29419921034 Spoodle Portion 5 oz. Purple Vollrath 6433580 Jacob's Pride EA $ 18.48 

190 Scoops/Dishers 10029419426512 Spoodle Portion 6 oz. Teal Vollrath 6433655 Jacob's Pride EA $ 2.99 

191 Scoops/Dishers 10029419426536 
Spoodle Portion 8 oz. Orange Vollrath 6433865 Jacob's Pride 
8 oz. EA $ 2.99 

192 Shelving 41105416136 

Shelving Unit - 18" x 24" x 63"  Super Adjustable Super 
Erecta 4-Shelf Metroseal 3 Wire Stationary Starter Metro 
A316K3 EA $ 145.49 

193 Shelving 41105416228 
Shelving Unit -18" x 30" x 63"  Super Adjustable Super Erecta 
4-Shelf Metroseal 3 Wire Stationary Starter Metro A326K3 EA $ 169.49 

194 Shelving 41105416389 

Shelving Unit - 18" x 36" x 63"  Super Adjustable Super 
Erecta 4-Shelf Metroseal 3 Wire Stationary Starter Metro 
A336K3 EA $ 179.99 

195 Shelving 41105416488 

Shelving Unit - 18" x 42" x 63"  Super Adjustable Super 
Erecta 4-Shelf Metroseal 3 Wire Stationary Starter Metro 
A346K3 EA $ 199.49 

196 Shelving 41105416624 

Shelving Unit - 18" x 48" x 63"  Super Adjustable Super 
Erecta 4-Shelf Metroseal 3 Wire Stationary Starter Metro 
A356K3 EA $ 223.49 

197 Shelving 41105416846 

Shelving Unit - 18" x 60" x 63"  Super Adjustable Super 
Erecta 4-Shelf Metroseal 3 Wire Stationary Starter Metro 
A366K3 EA $ 244.49 

Vendor Item Number 

407FRWHIP10 

407FRWHIP18 

160TPH1011WH 

160TPH8BRWN 

167810CM15 

1673258 

407TPD30BK 

407TPD16BL 

407TPD12GN 

407TPD10IV 

407TPD8GY 

407TPD6WH 

92247389 

92247388 

4072OZPSPRD 

4073OZPSPIVY 

4074OZPSPWGN 

9226432520 

4078OZPSPWBL 

4072OZPSSRD 

4073OZPSSIVY 

4074OZPSSGN 

9226433580 

4076OZPSSBK 

4078OZPSSBL 

460EG1824K64 

460EG1830K64 

460EG1836K64 

460EG1842K64 

460EG1848K64 

460EG1860K64 
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Copy of Attachment 1 Smallwares Price Sheet 

ATTACHMENT #1 
All Items Are Approved Brands 

Line # Category Item Number Description Size Price 

198 Shelving 460EC1824KIT Shelf Kit 4-Shelves Chrome Regency 18" x 24" 74" Posts NSF  EA $ 149.99 

199 Shelving 460EC1836KIT Shelf Kit 4-Shelves Chrome Regency 18" x 36" 74" Posts NSF  EA $ 186.74 

200 Shelving 460EC1848KIT Shelf Kit 4-Shelves Chrome Regency 18" x 48" 74" Posts NSF  EA $ 223.49 

201 Shelving 460EC1860KIT Shelf Kit 4-Shelves Chrome Regency 18" x 60" 74" Posts NSF  EA $ 249.74 

202 Shelving 460EC1872KIT Shelf Kit 4-Shelves Chrome Regency 18" x 72"74" Posts NSF  EA $ 282.74 

203 Shelving PR48VX4-XDR 
Shelving Unit - 24" x 48" x 68" Mobile 4-tier tray/steam Pan  
Drying Rack w/Drip Tray EA $ 613.49 

204 Shelving 600DUN243612 
Shelve Dunnage 36" x 24" x 12" Aluminum 1715 LB capacity 
Regency EA $ 84.74 

205 Shelving 600DUN244812 
Shelve Dunnage 48" x 24" x 12" Aluminum 1780 LB capacity 
Regency EA $ 101.99 

206 Shelving 600DUN246012 
Shelve Dunnage 60" x 24" x 12" Aluminum 1850 LB capacity 
Regency EA $ 118.49 

207 Smallwares 176APRONVBRN 
Apron Dishwasher Vinyl Brown 38 Mil Heavyweight - 40"L x 
25"W Choice EA $ 11.24 

208 Smallwares 808M2489 
Basket Black Rectangular Rattan  16 1/4" x 11 1/4" x 3 1/2" 
Tablecraft M2489 EA $ 27.74 

209 Smallwares 2146RS6BK 
Bin Condiment Stand Set with 2-Tier Stand and 12" 
Condiment Cambro 6RS6110 Black Versa EA $ 133.49 

210 Smallwares 8884843BK 
Bin Condiment Stand Set with 3-Tier Stand and 11 1/4" 
Condiment Black Vollrath 4843-06 EA $ 85.49 

211 Smallwares 215PANICEBL 
Board Ice for Blue Full Size- 20 3/4" x 12 3/4" x 1 1/2"  
CaterGator EA $ 66.74 

212 Smallwares 80812463CF 
Bottle 24 oz. Squeeze with Cone Tip Opening Wide Mouth - 
12/Pack SelecTop Tablecraft 12463CF DZ $ 12.29 

213 Smallwares 649SP5DISC Disc Kit 5 Food Processor Robot Coupe EA $ 576.30 

214 Smallwares 64928131 Disc Slicing  9/16" Robot Coupe 28131 EA $ 325.89 

215 Smallwares 64928004 Disc Slicing 5/32" Robot Coupe 28004 EA $ 312.38 

216 Smallwares 27110854BKCL 
Dispenser Beverage 3 Gallon Black Premium TrimLine 
Carlisle 1085403 EA $ 44.99 

217 Smallwares 176BDC6BKKIT 
Dispenser Beverage Round 6 Gallon Translucent with Black 
Base Choice KIT $ 71.99 

218 Smallwares 712H5005TBK 
Dispenser Countertop Napkin  with Control Face Fullfold 
Venue  - Black Pearl San Jamar H5005TBK EA $ 71.99 

219 Smallwares 712H550S 
Dispenser Napkin Countertop Stand for Fullfold San Jamar 
H550S EA $ 28.49 

220 Smallwares 712H5005STBK 
Dispenser Napkin Stand Mount with Control Face Fullfold 
Venue  - Black Pearl San Jamar H5005STBK EA $ 77.99 

221 Smallwares 407OGZ6 
Holder / Organizer Bin SetSelf-Serve Condiment with Rack 
and 6 Bins  Brown ST $ 70.49 

222 Smallwares 808T6 Holder Squeeze Bottle Six Hole Tablecraft T6 EA $ 23.99 

223 Smallwares 3331B 
Opener Can Manual with Plated Steel Base Edlund-11100 Old 
Reliable EA $ 177.74 

224 Smallwares 177CU45ETL 
Percolator Coffee Urn  45 Cup (225oz) Double Wall Stainless 
Steel - 950W Avantco CU45ETL EA $ 104.99 

225 Smallwares 808664K Pump Kit Wide Mouth 1 oz. Maxi Pelican Tablecraft 664K EA $ 45.74 

226 Smallwares 511SCMDL5 
Scale Mechanical Dial Portion Control Kitchen Scale SCMDL5 
5 EA $ 82.49 

227 Smallwares 690FG2884CLR Scoop Clear Plastic Utility 32 oz. Rubbermaid FG288400CLR EA $ 5.99 

228 Smallwares 407AS38 Scoop One-Piece Aluminum  - 38 oz. EA $ 11.24 

Vendor Item Number 

460EC1824KIT 

460EC1836KIT 

460EC1848KIT 

460EC1860KIT 

460EC1872KIT 

460EG2448D1C 

600DUN243612 

600DUN244812 

600DUN246012 

176APRONVBRN 

808M2489 

2146RS6BK 

8884843BK 

215PANICEBL 

176SB24CW 

649SP5DISC 

64928131 

64928004 

176BD3BK2 

176BDC6BKKIT 

712H5005TBK 

712H550S 

712H5005STBK 

176CDB2X3BR 

808T6 

3331B 

177CU45ETL 

808664K 

511SCMDL5 

176PCSCOOP32 

407AS38 
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Copy of Attachment 1 Smallwares Price Sheet 

ATTACHMENT #1 
All Items Are Approved Brands 

Line # Category Item Number Description Size Price 

229 Smallwares 176DRYER5GL Spinner / Dryer 5 Gallon Salad Choice EA $ 149.99 

230 Smallwares 672738 Spoon Measuring Set 4-Piece Silver Stainless Steel ST $ 2.99 

231 Smallwares 407SLWS004P Spreader 4 1/4" Sandwich EA $ 5.99 

232 Smallwares 808M2489 
Basket Black Rectangular Rattan 16 1/4" x 11 1/4" x 3 1/2" 
Tablecraft M2489 EA $ 27.74 

233 Smallwares 6085924 Thermometer 3" Dial Refrigerator / Freezer Taylor 5924 EA $ 3.89 

234 Smallwares 9135989 
Thermometer Dial 0 to 220 degrees Fahrenheit 5" Instant 
Read Pocket Probe  Taylor 5989NFS EA $ 3.44 

235 Smallwares 913RFT2K Thermometer Dial Refrigerator / Freezer Taylor 3507 2 1/2" EA $ 3.89 

236 Smallwares 167700BRT24 
Towel Terry Bar 16" x 19" White 24 oz. 100% Cotton Ribbed -
12/Pack Choice DZ $ 8.24 

237 Smallwares 176BT20157BK Tub Bus , 20" x 15" x 7" Black Polypropylene  Choice EA $ 8.69 

238 Smallwares 591557278 
Wedger Kit Eight Section for 55500 Easy Chopper and 55450 
Easy Fry Kutter Nemco 55727-8 EA $ 162.53 

239 Trays 271614GN 
Tray 10" x 14" Green ABS Plastic Left Hand 6 Compartment 
Carlisle 61409 EA $ 6.74 

240 Trays 271614SL 
Tray 10" x 14" Slate Blue ABS Plastic Left Hand 6 
Compartment Carlisle 61459 EA $ 6.74 

241 Tray Cart DSD11 
Tray Cart Double Side Load Polymer 240 per side, 5" casters, 
Metro EA $ 1,407.00 

242 Tray Cart SSD16 
Tray Cart Single Side Load Polymer 240 per side, 5" casters, 
Metro EA $ 1,171.50 

243 Tray Cart A110 Tray Cart Dividers ( 1 rod with 2 dividers) EA $ 164.99 

244 Merchandiser 3902937 
Barrel Drink Ice Hawk 3902937 holds up to (106) 12 oz. cans, 
or (83) 12 oz. bottles EA $ 229.49 

Vendor Item Number 

176DRYER5GL 

4074PCDHWMS 

220SSPRDS55W 

808M2489 

9142DRFT 

914T220 

9142DRFT 

167700BRT24 

176BT20157WH 

591557278 

271614GN 

271614SL 

461DSD11 

461SSD16 

461A110 

465IRP5005BK 
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